—————————— Forwarded message ----------

From: "WillFiles" <will@wfiles.us>

Date: Dec 16, 2016 8:45 PM

Subject: Grant funds

To: "Denise Ringhand" <ringhanddenise@gmail.com>, "Charlotte Tharp" <charlotte@dhtcpa.com>

Cc: "Lisa Phillips" <Isphllps@gmail.com>, "Chuck Foster" <cfosterl76 @gmail.com>, "Patty Meritt" <pameritt@alaska.edu>,
<paula@bmgak.com>, <sstigar3548 @theupsstore.com>, <ljseville@psfinc.com>, "Julie Scott" <retplans@ptialaska.net>,
<b.shelden@msrmc.com>, <cherylm@catheatres.com>

Hello Grantees,
The D5010 Grants Committee has approved the following allocations to be added to your existing grants.

P-1211 Wasilla - Sound Proof Booth - $500 additional + your equal match
P-1217 Palmer - Malawi Childrens Village - $500 additional + your equal match
P-1216 Anchorage - Rotary D5010 Park - $800 additional + your equal match
P-1212 Susitna - Water Safety & Literacy - $1,000 additional + your equal match
P-1208 College - Read To Me - $1,000 additional + your equal match

By copy of this email, we are asking Charlotte Tharp, our Dist Grants Treasurer, to cut and send you checks for the above
amounts as soon as possible.

When you complete your Final Report, add the Additional Amount plus your equal match to the total and report the new
numbers, including all paid receipts or invoices. Contact Denise Ringhand if you have any questions. All Final Reports are due
within two months of project completion, but no later than May 30, 2017.

Good luck and thank you for providing outstanding service to your communities through the use of The Rotary Foundation
District Grants.

Rotary regards,
Will

Will Files
D5010 Grants Chair
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