
From: Valerie Bohonus
To: Jim Bissonett; tedhaynes.minc@gmail.com
Cc: "Mr Joseph Wolfe"
Subject: RE: Final Report for District Grant P-2781
Date: Tuesday, February 2, 2021 11:18:16 AM
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DG P-2781 Final Report.pdf
DG P-2781 Receipts.pdf

Hi Jim!
 
The instructions on the top of the Final Report form instruct one to submit the documents via the
www.matchinggrants.org website, as shown below where I highlighted in yellow. However, when I went
to that site, I could not find the way to upload them. I assumed one needed to log in through the
Administration button which requires an email and password. If this is not the case, but instead we are to
submit them directly to you then I have attached them to this email. For future reference, please clarify
how one is to submit final grant reports to the district.

Many thanks!
 
Valerie Bohonus
Administrative Director

501 E Osborn Road
Phoenix, AZ  85012
602.604.8221
 

From: Jim Bissonett <jim@jbsolutions.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, February 2, 2021 8:16 AM
To: tedhaynes.minc@gmail.com; 'Valerie Bohonus' <rotary@rotary100.org>
Cc: 'Mr Joseph Wolfe' <jjwolfeusa@yahoo.com>
Subject: RE: Final Report for District Grant P-2781
 
You do not have to log into the website, Valerie.  I need the signed final report sent to me along with receipts
and/or funds acknowledgments.
 
Jim Bissonett
 

From: tedhaynes.minc@gmail.com <tedhaynes.minc@gmail.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, February 2, 2021 6:23 AM
To: 'Valerie Bohonus' <rotary@rotary100.org>
Cc: 'Mr Joseph Wolfe' <jjwolfeusa@yahoo.com>; Jim Bissonett <jim@jbsolutions.com>
Subject: RE: Final Report for District Grant P-2781
 
Thanks for the follow up Valerie.  This sounds like a Jim question as I have not visited the website myself.  Jim?
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for District Grants completed in Rotary year 2019-
1) Please type all answers. 2.

Fa.) Scan and upload a separate pdf file of receipts that are marked "PAIl
0 NOT upload 'bills due' or invoices. Do NOT pload check copies or bank statements.




































 
Thanks again to everybody.
 
Ted
 

From: Valerie Bohonus <rotary@rotary100.org> 
Sent: Monday, February 01, 2021 7:08 PM
To: tedhaynes.minc@gmail.com
Cc: 'Mr Joseph Wolfe' <jjwolfeusa@yahoo.com>; 'Jim Bissonett' <jim@jbsolutions.com>
Subject: RE: Final Report for District Grant P-2781
 
Hello Gentlemen!
 
I have all the documentation ready for submission but it appears I need to log into the website
www.matchinggrants.org. However, I do not know the email address and password to do so. Does
anyone have this information to share or do I need to email all the documentation to someone? Please
advise.
 
Cheers!
 
Valerie Bohonus
Administrative Director

501 E Osborn Road
Phoenix, AZ  85012
602.604.8221
 

From: tedhaynes.minc@gmail.com <tedhaynes.minc@gmail.com> 
Sent: Monday, January 25, 2021 10:03 AM
To: 'Valerie Bohonus' <rotary@rotary100.org>
Cc: 'Mr Joseph Wolfe' <jjwolfeusa@yahoo.com>; 'Jim Bissonett' <jim@jbsolutions.com>
Subject: FW: Final Report for District Grant P-2781
 
Hello Valerie.  I am sending you this e-mail  in the hope that you will hold onto it until you and I can talk about it.
 
I am hoping that I can stop into the office later on this week (I am tentatively thinking Thursday after I help the
Salvation Army with the Salads and Go event- should be over around 11:00) and you and I can complete this and
send it off.
 
We are completing the lower division finals this afternoon- so then we should know who wins what.  I have
talked to Jim Bissonett earlier this morning about what will be needed to complete this for the District Grant
Report.
 
Thanks Valerie- I will be in contact with you in the next day or two.
 
Ted
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From: Mr Joseph Wolfe <jjwolfeusa@yahoo.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, January 05, 2021 10:21 AM
To: Ted Haynes <thaynes@mckeowninc.com>; Jim & Wendy Bissonett <jim@jbsolutions.com>
Subject: Fw: Final Report for District Grant P-2781
 
Ted,
 
Working on closing out grant.  Do we have an expense report for 2019-
20 as last paragraph?
 
Thanks
 
Joe
 
Joseph Wolfe
 
 
----- Forwarded Message -----
From: Jim Bissonett <jim@jbsolutions.com>
To: Mr Joseph Wolfe <jjwolfeusa@yahoo.com>
Sent: Tuesday, January 5, 2021, 10:06:32 AM MST
Subject: Final Report for District Grant P-2781
 

Joe, here is your 2019-20 District Grant link: http://www.matchinggrants.org/district/project2781.html    The attached Final
Report Form can be completed by you, and then it must be signed by the current club President. 

The prior year of 2018-19 show these documents:  http://www.matchinggrants.org/district/project2236.html.  In that year, the
receipts were for expenses of the event.  I am not sure your club had any of those type of expenses in 2019-20.   We may need to
figure out how to show a receipt or some acknowledgement for the funds being deposited for the awards.  Let’s talk further.

 

Jim Bissonett

480-299-4441
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