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Summer Jackman

From: Jean Haneke <jmhaneke@me.com>

Sent: Monday, May 13, 2019 3:15 PM

To: Greg Gunter

Cc: summer@summerjackman.com; SAM; Rebecca Webb; Michael Jones

Subject: [EXTERNAL]  Re: District grant application

Hi Greg,  
 

Thanks, Greg. We did receive a $5,000. check from ICCU at the Groundbreaking, and I don’t see it listed; Lauren 

Sorenson is in our club and works at ICCU. That along with Paul Yokum’s donation of $1,000. should get us to $26,000. 

received. Jay Colonel from Ireland Bank put in a request today for a $3,000. donation for the Marine Flagpole and flag, 

and Paul Yokum of FMC has submitted requested paperwork to receive a $3,000. donation for a Plaza Bench. Hopefully 

those will be received in time to add to the final grant (if there is no cap).  

 

Summer and Greg, please let me know if you need any paperwork or help from me. Thank you both SO much for 

working on this District Grant on behalf of IGSFMM!! 

 

Jean 

 

Sent from my iPhone 

 

On May 13, 2019, at 2:29 PM, Greg Gunter <greg@ravecommunications.com> wrote: 

Hi, Summer. Here’s the initial information we have regarding donations to the Idaho Gold Star Families 

Memorial Monument and Plaza.  

  

Donations from members. Some are already financing specific components:   

  

Kelly Hirning (Hirning Buick GMC)                             $6,000                (2 flagpoles) 

Mary Johnson (McDonald’s)                                       $3,000                (Bench) 

Richie Evans (DL Evans Bank)                                     $3,000                 (Flagpole) 

Amy Rhodes (Citizens Community Bank)                $3,000                  (Bench) 

Lance Buttars (Molinelli’s Jewelers)                         $ 500                    (Service emblem) 

Matt Hunter (Chamber of Commerce)                    $1,500                  (Not tied to any component.) 

Saeid Rezaii (Galaxy Computers)                                $100. 

Sam & Cleo Nettinga                                                      $100 

Mark Nye                                                                            $100 

Robert Jensen (Vogt’s Heating & Cooling)              $100. 

Scott Cornelison (Cornelison Funeral Home)        $1000. 

Paul Jochum                                                                       $1,000                   (This was the information I was 

given today – it does not match what I was told last week. – GG)  

Art Hirning                                                                          $100. 

Gordon Wilks (Gate City Realty)                                 $500 

Arlo Luke (Varsity Facility Services)                           $1000 

  

Total:                                                                     $21,000 
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A 50-percent match of $10,500 combined with the $5,500 in those donations above not tied to any 

specific components, would allow us to complete the $18,000 two-tone granite gold star that is a 

centerpiece of the plaza, symbolizing the Gold Star Families who have lost a loved one to military 

service. (The $200 shortfall would be made up from general donations.) 

  

The dedication of the monument and plaza is tentatively schedule for this fall; however, it will definitely 

be no later than spring of 2020.  

  

Of course, Pocatello Rotary Club/Rotary District 5400 would be listed on the project’s granite Sponsors 

monument and on the Gold Star Families Memorial Monument permanent website as a Gold Sponsor. 

  

Summer, based on what Marianne Barker told you, would this information work for a grant submission?  

  

Thanks,  

Greg    

  

  

  

  

_____________________________ 

Rave Communications, Inc. 
                       "we work"  

Build your brand. Move your audience. Get results. 

To learn more, call today:  
611 Wilson, Suite 4A 

Pocatello, ID 83201 

208-235-4270 

www.ravecommunications.com 
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