sue.linn50@gmail.com

From: _ Lesley Gottlinger <bookgramma@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, February 28, 2020 2:23 PM

To: Sue Linn -

Cc: Bill Lyman; Lesley Gottlinger; HOME

Subject: Fwd: Addendum Project P-2849

Sue, *

Please upload this email to District Grant Project P-2849. Once that is done, would
you let Bill and me know. We can then take it from there to complete our review.

Thanks very much. See you tomorrow.
Lesley and Bill

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: b:_ill paglia <billpaglia@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, Feb 26, 2020 at 7:48 AM

Subject: Addendum Project P-2849
To: <bookgramma@gmail.com>, William Lyman <wclyman2 @gmail.com>

Lesley/Bill - just clarifying the information on District Grant project p_2849.....Even though the total invoice for

the project equipment is $4551, the RC of Orland Park covered $1500 of that amount shown by the already cancelled
check #8117. This email will serve to amend the oroject's Final Report so that itam #'s 8 and 9 can balance. The line item
showing other funding should be deleted from Item #8, leaving item #8 with a total of $1500, and item #9 should reflect

an expenditure of $1500.

Please insert this as an addendum to the project and advise if any further clarification is needed.

Thanks,
- Bill Paglia .
president - Rotary Club of Orland Park

Bill Paglia |
Wild Blue Yonder Travel
708.460.3192 (office)
708.334.2149 (mobile)
708.298.5904 (fax)

billpaglia@gmail.com



