Scott McLaughlin - Heartland Hosting

From: Srivatsa Seshadri <seshadris@unk.edu>

Sent: Tuesday, May 17, 2016 7:23 PM

To: rkrato52@charter.net

Cc: Scott MclLaughlin - Heartland Hosting

Subject: RE: You just sent a payment to Alina Matvejane for this invoice 0020

Thanks. Randy.

From: rkrato52@charter.net [mailto:rkrato52@charter.net]

Sent: Tuesday, May 17, 2016 6:33 PM

To: Srivatsa Seshadri <seshadris@unk.edu>

Cc: 'Scott MclLaughlin - Heartland Hosting' <Scott@HeartlandHosting.com>
Subject: RE: You just sent a payment to Alina Matvejane for this invoice 0020

Done,
Check written to Melissa and will mail in the morning.

Randy

From: "Srivatsa Seshadri"

To: "Randy Kratochvil (rkrato52@charter.net)"

Cc: "Scott McLaughlin - Heartland Hosting"

Sent: Tue, 17 May 2016 16:00:40 +0000

Subject: RE: You just sent a payment to Alina Matvejane for this invoice 0020

Thanks, Scott

Randy,
I will not be in town till May 31. Could you please make out the check to Melissa Pandorf for $520 check and mail it to:

Melissa Pandorf
2111 W 49th St.
Kearney NE 68845

Thanks.

Best regards,

Sri

Prof. Sri Seshadri, Ph.D., C.G.B.P.
Professor, Marketing

Director, MBA
http://www.unk.edu/mba

(308) 865 8190




From: Scott MclLaughlin - Heartland Hosting [mailto:Scott@HeartlandHosting.com]
Sent: Tuesday, May 17, 2016 10:56 AM

To: Srivatsa Seshadri <seshadris@unk.edu>

Cc: 'Randy Kratochvil (rkrato52 @charter.net)' <rkrato52@charter.net>

Subject: RE: You just sent a payment to Alina Matvejane for this invoice 0020

Yes. Randy should be able to take care of that in the morning.
Sincerely,
Scott A. McLaughlin

President, Heartland Hosting, LLC
scott@heartlandhosting.com

Toll Free: (877) 906-HOST (4678)
Mobile: (308) 440-9240
FAX (754) 227-0000

Heartland Hosting, LLC

1114 E. 48th St.

Kearney, NE 68847, USA
http://www.heartlandhosting.com

The information contained in this e-mail is privileged and confidential and is intended only for the use of the
addressee(s) indicated above. Use or disclosure of information e-mailed in error is respectfully prohibited. If you have
received this e-mail in error, please contact the sender and immediately delete the original message. Thank you.

From: Srivatsa Seshadri [mailto:seshadris@unk.edu]

Sent: Tuesday, May 17, 2016 10:53 AM

To: Scott McLaughlin - Heartland Hosting <Scott@HeartlandHosting.com>; Dale Schultz <dschultz1949 @gmail.com>
Subject: FW: You just sent a payment to Alina Matvejane for this invoice 0020

Scott,

See email below. These are materials bought by a board member for our Children’s museum project. (There will be
other invoices coming in, and they may be in either the board member’s name or Children’s Museum)

Can we write a check to the board member Melissa Pandorf for $520?

Best regards,
Sri

Prof. Sri Seshadri, Ph.D., C.G.B.P.
Professor, Marketing

Director, MBA
http://www.unk.edu/mba
(308) 865 8190

From: Traci Winscot [mailto:traci@kearneychildrensmuseum.org]
Sent: Tuesday, May 17, 2016 10:48 AM




To: Srivatsa Seshadri <seshadris@unk.edu>
Subject: Fwd: You just sent a payment to Alina Matvejane for this invoice 0020

Hi Sri,

Here is the receipt that Melissa bought the felt produce from Etsy! Can Rotary write her a $520 check directly?
Melissa Pandorf

2111 W 49th St.

Kearney NE 68845

—————————— Forwarded message ----------

From: service@paypal.com <service@paypal.com>

Date: Sun, May 8, 2016 at 7:01 AM

Subject: You just sent a payment to Alina Matvejane for this invoice 0020
To: Melissa Pandorf <mmscottp@gmail.com>

’ PayPal

. May 8, 2016 05:00:58 PDT
You just sent a $§520.00 USD payment Transaction ID: 3GD3748625434691G

Hello Melissa Pandorf,

Thanks for using PayPal. It may take a few moments for this transaction to appear in your
account.

See your invoice

Merchant Note to Alina Matvejane
Alina Matvejane You haven't sent a note.
ladybugonchamomile@gmail.com

Shipping address - confirmed
Melissa Pandorf

2111 W. 49th Street

Kearney, NE 68845

United States

Description Unit price Qty  Amount

-THESE ITEMS WILL BE MADE AS FELT MAGNETS:
Apple tree Cows (x5) Hens (x5.. creamy and white
color mix is fine) Milk cows (x3 is this possible?) Sheep
(x2) Pigs (x2) Horse Xray Fish (x5) Corn (x5) Wheat
plant (x5 is this possible) Soybeans plant (x2 is this
possible...it would look a lot like the peas you make
now) Cotton plant ( X2 is this possible) Barley plant (
X2 is this possible) Oats plant ( X2 is this possible?)

$520.00 1 $520.00



Potato (x2) Bison Deer Trees (x5) Shrimp Lobster Crab
Bananas Oranges (x2) ALSO | WILL SPLIT THE LIST IN
4 PARTIES WHICH | WILL MAKE AND SEND
SEPARATELY AS SOON AS POSSIBLE STANDARD
SHIPPING !l

Subtotal $520.00

Total $520.00 USD
Amount Paid $520.00 USD
Amount due $0.00 USD

Charge will appear on your credit card statement as PAYPAL *LADYBUGTOYS
Payment sent to Alina Matvejane

Invoice ID 0020

Receipt
Sender Recipient
Melissa Pandorf Alina Matvejane
mmscottp@gmail.com ladybugonchamomile@gmail.com

Funds will be available to your recipient on or before: May 9, 2016

Note: The recipient can send or spend the full amount on this date. If the recipient wishes
to withdraw money, limits may apply.

Description Amount
Payment amount (in currency funded): $520.00 USD
Your total charge: $520.00 USD
Payment amount: $520.00 USD
Alina's fees: $23.18 USD
Alina will receive: $496.82 USD

Need to cancel?

You can cancel your payment within 30 minutes as long as the recipient hasn't received the
payment. For a full refund, see the transaction details and select Cancel, or call Customer
Service at 888-221-1161.

About disputes

If this payment is for an item you purchased but haven't received, or it's not as described,
your purchase may be covered under PayPal's purchase protection. In those cases, you can
file a dispute in the Resolution Center within 180 days of payment. Just log in to PayPal at
www.paypal.com and go to the Resolution Center or call Customer Service at 877-569-
1141.

If you have a different problem with this payment sent to someone outside the United
States - for example, the payment was never received, or it was processed for the wrong
amount, - you have up to 180 days to dispute it. To file a dispute for this payment or to



request a written explanation of your rights, go to the Resolution Center or call Customer
Service.

If you don't recognize this payment or want to report it as unauthorized, you can file a
dispute in the Resolution Center at any time. To file a dispute, go to the Resolution Center
or call Customer Service.

If you aren't satisfied with the service that PayPal's provided you, you can contact these
agencies:

Texas Department of Banking

(512) 475-1300
http://www.banking.state.tx.us/

Consumer Financial Protection Bureau
855-411-2372 or 855-729-2372 (TTY/TDD)

http://www.consumerfinance.gov

Help | Resolution Center @ Security Center

For assistance with matters regarding your PayPal account not identified above, please contact us toll free at 1-
888-221-1161.

Please don't reply to this email. It'll just confuse the computer that sent it and you won't get a response.

Copyright © 2016 PayPal, Inc. All rights reserved. PayPal is located at 2211 N. First St., San Jose, CA 95131.

PayPal Email ID PP1526 - b788e6b57ff15

Traci Winscot

Executive Director

5827 4th Avenue

Kearney, NE 68845

Phone: 308.698.2228, ext. 5
traci@kearneychildrensmuseum.org

www.kearneychildrensmuseum.org

“

@ [ KEARNEY AREA |'q
= > children’s
museum

Join us Thursday, May 19th at 6:00 pm to help celebrate KACM's Birthday in honor of Alia
Arram!



