
Subject: RE: MG 61746 - Final Report 

Date: Wed, 25 Jun 2008 13:45:31 -0500 

From: "Jennifer Kordell" <Jennifer.Kordell@rotary.org>  Add to Address Book  Add Mobile Alert  

To: "Susan Thorning" <sthorning@sbcglobal.net> 

CC: 
zvoronova@dstu.dp.ua, thunter930@aol.com, arrun3m@aol.com,  drjeffmoses@yahoo.com, jpotepa@neostrada.pl, 

dan@genslergroup.com 

 
RE: MG 61746 to help provide medical equipment to a hospital in Dneprodzerzhinsk, Ukraine 
  
Dear Rotarian Thorning, 
  
Thank you for the additional bank statements.  Your cooperation in fulfilling this requirement is greatly appreciated.  As all 
required information has been received, The Rotary Foundation has marked this file closed.  Best of luck in your future 
humanitarian endeavors! 

Best regards,  
Jennifer Kordell 
Grant Coordinator 
Humanitarian Grants Program 
The Rotary Foundation 
Phone: 847-866-3104 
Fax: 847-866-9759 
Email: jennifer.kordell@rotary.org  

 
From: Susan Thorning [mailto:sthorning@sbcglobal.net]  
Sent: Tuesday, 24 June, 2008 5:29 PM 
To: Jennifer Kordell 
Subject: Re: MG 61746 - Final Report 

Thank you  Jennifer.  I will get this sent off tomorrow.  Sorry, I assumed that the statement for March was sufficient since it 
showed a balance of more than the 12,650 in the account. Our district report shows that payment as having been 
made on January 31, 2008.   
  
Susan Thorning 
858-336-6474  
 
Jennifer Kordell <Jennifer.Kordell@rotary.org> wrote: 
Dear Rotarian Thorning,  
I received the complete final report for MG 61746.  Please submit the relevant copy of the bank statement for the deposit 
of the grant funds (USD 12,650) into the project account at San Diego National Bank. 
Thank you!  
 


