Date
6/4/2020

712012020
712112020

7/28/2020

8/5/2020

8/17/2020
8/20/2020

8/20/2020
8/20/2020

9/10/2020

9/21/2020
9/21/2020

9/20/2020

10/13/2020
10/16/2020

11/12/2020

11/12/2020
12/5/2020
1/28/2021
2/17/2021

3/4/2021
6/10/2021
71812021
7/23/2021

8/24/2021

8/26/2021
9/27/2021
11/17/2021
12/13/2021
1/6/2022

Active Grants - Little Free Libraries

Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:

Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:

Registration

Little Free Libraries:

Supplies

Little Free Libraries:

Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:

Signs

Little Free Libraries:

Little Free Libraries:

Construction

Little Free Libraries:

Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:

Construction

Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:

Decals, Books

Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:

Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:

Construction

Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:
Little Free Libraries:

Little Free Libraries

Description
Approved by Board

- Ann Kling - Books

Donation from J Giffin

District 5440 Matching Grant
Joe Schroeder - Construction Kit and

Clearview Library Foundation -

Coren Printing - Signs
Ron Clark - Construction
Mike Carey - Construction, Posts,

Charlotte Ryan - Signs

John Warford - Construction
Coren Printing - Book Stickers
Words of Windsor - Books

Jody Niswender - Paint & Paint

TW Woodworking - Construction

Charlotte Ryan - Sign Supplies
Little Free Libraries Ltd. - Charter

Coren Printing - Stickers for Books

Coren Printing - Sponsor Stickers

Coren Printing - QR Code Decals
Clearview Library Foundation -

Kris Kazian - Concrete for Posts
John Warford - Construction
Coren Printing - Book Stickers
Jim Lindahl - Construction
Coren Printing - Signs

Coren Printing - Book Stickers
John Warford - Construction

Coren Printing - Book Stickers
Clearview Library Foundation -

TOTAL

$
b
$

$

Income

3,180.00
100.00
3,000.00

6,280.00

Expense

$ 346.07

210.87

300.00
11.72

318.71

63.00
300.00

63.00
66.33

300.00

97.50
300.00

1,192.20

$

$

5

5

S

$

$

$

$

$

$

$

$ 7.46
$ 435.00
$ 125.00
$ 300.00
$ 275.00
$ 75.00
$ 300.00
$ 125.00
$

$

$

$

b2

$

$

300.00

86.07
300.00
91.00
175.56
115.51
6,280.00

Summary

Budget

Used

Remaining

$

6,280.00

$  (6,280.00)

S
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Scott Bailey

From: RONALD CLARK <rclark1032@comcast.net>
Sent: Sunday, September 13, 2020 3:22 PM

To: Scott Bailey

Subject: Re: Rotary - LFL

Scott:

Thank you for the update and for keeping track of our expenditures. Authorized expenses include
cost of the structure itself, usually about $300. Jody for paint supplies. Ann for "seed” books. These
are books we want every LFL to have at the beginning. | think she has already done this for most of
the LFLs. Cost of the posts. Mike Carey will be doing this. Registration and signs, Charlotte. That's
about it. Thanks again,

Ron

On 09/10/2020 10:12 AM Scott Bailey <sbailey@windsorstatebank.com> wrote:

Ron, Here is an update of where you are at with the LFL funding. Let me know if you have
questions. Thanks, Scott

Scott Bailey

VP - Loan Officer

NMLS# 484076

1130 Main St. | Windsor, CO 80550

970 674-1488 | Fax 970 674-0166

LS s sossai

www.windsorstatebank.com




Scott Bailey

From: RONALD CLARK <rclark1032@comcast.net>
Sent; Saturday, September 25, 2021 11:33 AM
To: Scott Bailey

Subject: Little Free Library

Scott:

Well, We just installed our 12th and last LFL. If you would please send a check for $300 to John
Warford, 444 10th Street. Loveland, CO, 80537. Also, let me know how much we have remaining in
our LFL fund. We will use the remaining funds to purchase books.

Ron



Packing Slip

, iij Date : 08/05/2021
B se— Order# : #73203
I L IR EE LR AR e
Charlotte RYAN Charlotte RYAN
Rotary Club of Windsor Rotary Club of Windsor
1228 Brookwood Ct 1228 Brookwood Ct
WINDSOR, CO 80550 WINDSOR, CO 80550
us us
(970) 978-9817 (970) 978-9817
ckryan48@msn.com ckryan48@msn.com

Aluminum

Charter Sign

Shipping Method : UPS Mail Innovations 9 I

Thank you for your order! Your ltems May Ship Separately!



Scott Bailey

From: RONALD CLARK <rclark1032@comcast.net>
Sent: Tuesday, August 24, 2021 8:51 AM

To: Scott Bailey

Subject: Little Free Library

Scott:

We just installed a LFL at Skyview Elementary School. Would you please send a check for $300 to
the Clearview Library Foundation in honor of John Pope?

Thank you,
Ron Clark
, \5‘1(3
I
b )
.\/ YA
}@l% I\/LJ/
e
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Scott Bailey

From: RONALD CLARK <rclark1032@comcast.net>
Sent: Friday, December 4, 2020 2:36 PM
To: Scott Bailey
Subject: Little Free Libraries
Scott:
Would you please send a check in he amount of $435 to: John Warford, 444 West 10th Street,
Loveland, Colorado for the Clock, LFL he made?
Thank you,
Ron Clark
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Scott Bailey

From: Kris Kazian <kkazian@wsfr.us>
Sent: Thursday, June 17, 2021 3:52 PM )
To: Scott Bailey _ \() \L/
Subject: RE: Silent Auction . \C {\
oA ( w A
| will be in the area in the AM if that works / L l(ﬁ
| /
The reimbursement for $90.74 iﬂs/i‘or Jim Hays (works for me and went to Lowes for materials) e )
KKris Kazian
Fire Chief
Windsor Severance Fire Rescue
100 7th Street — Windsor, CO 80550
Main 970.686.2626
Cell 847.778.0411
Email — Kkazian@wsfr.us
www.wsfr.us
Like us on Instagram, Twitter, and Facebook
From: Scott Bailey <shailey@windsorstatebank.com> \/[) . (\,z\
Sent: Thursday, June 17, 2021 3:49 PM - 0 \/«J
To: Kris Kazian <kkazian@wsfr.us> 7 N

Subject: RE: Silent Auction

No hurry, I can get it when you get back or whatever

From: Kris Kazian <kkazian@wsfr.us>

Sent: Thursday, June 17, 2021 3:48 PM

To: Scott Bailey <shailey@windsorstatebank.com>
Subject: Re: Silent Auction

He dropped it off to me. | need to get to you. Could get it you you tomorrow or might be able to catch you before you go
today but not sure | can make that before 5!

I also have a receipt for the Neighborhood connect project- getting the trailer fixed up a bit!

Kris Kazian

Fire Chief

Windsor Severance Fire Rescue

100 7th Street — Windsor, CO 80550

Main 970.686.2626

Cell 847.778.0411

Email — Kkazian@wsfr.us

www.wsfr.us

Like us on Instagram, Twitter, and Facebook




Coren Printing, Inc. St at eme nt
631 Birch Street, Suite A
Windsor, CO 80550 Date
3/1/2021
Bill To
Windsor Rotary Club
P.O.Box 23
Windsor, CO 80550
Amount Due Amount Enc.
$275.00
Date Description Amount Balance
01/31/2021 Balance forward 125.00
02/08/2021 PMT #1050, 29762 -125.00 0.00
02/11/2021 INV #29913. 275.00 275.00
"Little Free Library", 18x24, 4mm coroplast, 4/0
--- Full Color Printing, 10 @ $25 =250.00
--- Miscellaneous, 10 @ $2.5 =25.00
- Charlotte Ryan
--- Tax: Non-Taxable @ 0.00 = 0.00
A
N7y
= BN
Al \U
A
\- .
U g )>
(r
31-60 Days Past 61-90 Days Past Over 90 Days Past
Current 1-30 Days Past Due Due Due Due Amount Due
275.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 $275.00




Scott Bailey

From: RONALD CLARK <rclark1032@comcast.net>
Sent: Thursday, February 11, 2021 9:20 AM

To: Scott Bailey

Subject: Litle Free Library

Scott:

Would you please send a check for $300 to: Jim Lindahl, 1350 Redwood, Windsor, CO 805507 He
built the LFL that we recently installed in Severance.
Ron Clark

# a§Z
Y/( /(7/7J?/\

Rotary Club of Windsor

sv?ndg)c()r CO 80550 » QMQ { ' 82-233(/)1?221
- 4
) Date
rove ) IM LI PAHL s 2p0 —
Thatt Mo bed £ % i
v A b /éé,/ (L ////5 — ﬁsmrﬂyhamm;
i Dollars Detate an hack
g
éﬁ%%%u mog@rbr@i@[%@ﬁk —

1130 Main St, Windsor, CO 80550 » (970)674 1488
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202402938 20 RN e

Pdzin Skeet  Vindsor Slale Bank
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Scott Bailey

From: RONALD CLARK <rclark1032@comcast.net>
Sent: Friday, December 4, 2020 2:36 PM

To: Scott Bailey

Subject: Little Free Libraries

Scott:

Would you please send a check in he amount of $435 to: John Warford, 444 West 10th Street,
Loveland, Colorado for the Clock, LFL he made?

Thank you,
Ron Clark



Scott Bailey

From: Mike Carey <mcareymd@aol.com>
Sent: Tuesday, December 1, 2020 4.00 PM
To: Scott Bailey

Subject: Re: Rotary - Board Meeting

Thanks, Scott. By the way, We have mlsplaced the check for LFL expenses. Could you issue another one and void the
one you mailed? e e T

Thanks, Mike

From: Scott Bailey <sbailey@windsorstatebank.com>

To: Ann Kling <director@clearviewlibrary.org>; Charlotte Ryan <ckryan48@msn.com>; Jody Niswender
<jodynis@qwestoffice.net>; Joe Schroeder <joeschroeder000@gmail.com>; Karen Trusler <klchoc@aol.com>; Kris
Kazian <kkazian@wsfr.us>; Michael Carey <mcareymd@aol.com>; Robina McWilliams <robina@Ilpbroadband.net>
Sent: Tue, Dec 1, 2020 3:54 pm

Subject: Rotary - Board Meeting

Attached are the financials. Not much activity this month.
We still have 8 members that have not paid their dues and 3 of those are past-due for more than 1 gtr.

Thanks, Scott

Scott Bailey
VP - Loan Officer WG
NMLS# 484076 W N
1130 Main St. | Windsor, CO 80550 Eo
970 674-1488 | Fax 970 674-0166 b\L L&
o W S S AR
ugwindsorﬁmg}argg \F&Q " o
- ) A \qd

www.windsorstatebank.com G Y5 \g



Scott Bailey
Hi Scott,

Here is a list of my expenses towards the Little Free Library project. Please reimburse me.

1. Little Free Library purchased from Stuckey’s Woodworking in Vauxhall Alberta.
(See the thank you note and credit card statements) S 293.94
S 38.56
$ 332.50
2. Lumber for LFL posts and platforms (2 receipts from Home Depot) S 53.24
$ 115.20
S 164.88
3. Russel-Hampton Company {Rotary whee! decals for LFL) S 53.99
4, Scholastic Press (children’s bhooks for the LFL project) S 640.83

TOTAL




October 19, 2020

COLLEEN LODERMEIER

MOUNTAIN VIEW ELEMENTARY SCH
810 3RD ST

WINDSOR, CO 80550-5424

Dear Customer: Customer# 544056229

Please let this letter serve as receipt of payment on your Scholastic Book Clubs Account. Payment in the
amount of $640.83 was received on 09/16/20 on your Scholastic Book Clubs Account. Payment was made via
credit card number ending in 5895.

If you need additional information or have other concerns, please do not hesitate to contact us.

Sincerely,

Andrea Roland
Scholastic Book Clubs Customer Service
1-800-724-6527
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Scott Bailey

From: RONALD CLARK <rclark1032@comcast.net>
Sent: Sunday, November 8, 2020 11:14 AM

To: Scott Bailey

Subject: Re: Rotary

Scott:

Yes. Go ahead and pay the full amount.

Ron

On 11/06/2020 11:08 AM Scott Bailey <sbailey(@windsorstatebank.com> wrote:

Hey Ron, Do you want me to pay Mike Carey’s invoice? Thanks, Scott

Scott Bailey

VP - Loan Officer

NMLS# 484076

1130 Main St. | Windsor, CO 80550

970 674-1488 | Fax 970 674-0166

“ _hf.r‘*"lh,.‘: s i
UESuindearsonsain

www,windsorstatebank.com
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10/7/2020 Account Detail - Wells Fargo

Check Details

Check Number 7973

04/02/20 S -
$300 OO

Date Posted
Check Amount
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Scott Bailey

From: RONALD CLARK <rclark1032@comcast.net>
Sent: Sunday, September 27, 2020 10:41 AM

To: Scott Bailey

Subject: Little Free Libraries

Scott:

John Pope has built and we have planted a second LFL. If you would please send yhe Clearview
Library Foundation a gift of $300 in his name | would appreciate it.
Ron
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Scott Bailey

From: RONALD CLARK <rclark1032@comcast.net>
Sent: Sunday, September 6, 2020 8:53 AM

To: Scott Bailey

Subject: Donation

Scott;

Would you please send a Rotary Club donation of égopfto the Clearview Library Foundation, 720 3rd
Street, Windsor,Co 80550 in honor of Dr. John Pope?
Thank you,

Ron



AmazonSmile - Order 111-4929698-7629053 https://smile.amazon.com/gp/css/summary/print.html/ref=ppx_od_d...

dimazon

2 ol . wih AT 1 4 i1 4
Bon Sompn @Seepdenp 200 1 4 L AL
PE gaRy ASe ar k Lo

Print this page for your records.

Order Placed: August 16, 2020

Amazon.com order number: 111-4929698-7629053
Order Total: $11.72

Supporting: St. Jude Children's Research Hospital

Not Yet Shipped

Items Ordered Price
1 of: MFLABEL Thermal Laminating Pouches, 8.9 x 11.4-Inches, 3 mil Thick, 100- $11.39

Pack
Sold by: Onelink Mall (seller profile) | Product question? Ask Seller

Condition: New

/" Shipping Address:
J Charlotte Ryan
{ 1228 BROOKWOOD CT
* WINDSOR, CO 80550-5926
\ United States

Shipping Speed:
One-Day Shipping

Payment information

Payment Method: Item(s) Subtotal: $11.39
Amazon.com Visa Signature | Last digits: 1659 Shipping & Handling: $0.00
g:;i:itaéd:y;enss Total before tax: $11.39
1598 Brookwood Ct Estimated tax to be collected: $?__3.3_
Windsor, CO 80550 Grand Total:$11.72

United States

To view the status of your order, return to Order Summary.

Conditions of Use | Privacy Notice ® 1996-2020, Amazon.com, Inc. or its affilates - ;]

Lof 1 8/16/2020. 1:58 PM
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USA

P.O. Nurmnber

i
B

Quantity
10

—

Little Free Library Ltd.

573 County Road A

Suite 106

Hudson, WI 54016

Bill To
Rofary Club of Windsor
Charlotte Ryan
PO Box 23

Windsor, CO 80550

Terms

ltem Code

White Aluminum C...

Shipping

Rep l

Ship

1 8/18/2020

Description

White Aluminum Charter Sign

SHIPPING

Discount for Bulk Order

Via

UPS

Ship To

I’{ch)t'arly ‘Cyhib of Windsor

Charlotte Ryan

1228 Brookwood Ct

Windsor, CO 80550
USA

F.O.B.

Price Each
30.00
18.71

’ Total

__Date | Invoice#

8/18/2020 ’

Project

Invoice

5811

Amount

300.00
18.71

$318.71




1369 Sunset Bay Drive, Windsar, O

80550
9703025735

Invoice #2020-801 Lﬁ \DZ)\\)

Date: 8/27/2020 /79\ cE Y
it 2

A7 9

Bill To For

Rotary Club of Windsor Little Free Library - Build

PO Box 23

Windsor, CO 80550

Item Descri rti,oﬁ: -

Materials 12.64
Labor - 6 hrs @ $60/hr $36OV.OO
Donation to Rotary | -$242.64
Subtotal $300.CO
Tax Rate 0.0d% |

Other Costs | $O;OO

Total Cost

Make all checks payable to Tyler Wallace

If you have any questions concerning this invoice, use the contact information above

Thank you for your business!



PATNT & DESIGN

NOCO Paint
1490 Main St Suit B
Windsor CO 80550

Fhone: (970) 460.9855

Sale

Sold To: NISWENDER Slip: 000147714
Jody Niswender Date: 7/14/2020
T737County Red 72 Time: 12:37 PM
Windsor CO 80850

Clerk: GF
Tarm NOCO-PC
Mem QY Pie  Total
N4O33A004 1QT 19.09 10,94
REGAL SELECT HB SFT-BASE 4
Color Mumnber: 1308
Color Name: Charmed Violet
Farmula: 2 81, 40 W1, 30.5 M,
6.25 B1
List $22.99
00004777
N4033X004 1ar 18.99 19.99
REGOAL SELECT HB SFT-BASE 3

Color Number: HO-51
Color Name: Audubon Russat

Formula: 38.5 Y3, 4.6 81, 25 W1,
30.26 R2

List $22.60

QU

0000014776
N4(34 X004 FQT 10.99 18.99
REGAL SELECT HB SFT-BASE 4
Color Number: 2000-20
Color Name: Tricycle Red
Formula: 11,25 Y3, 30.28 W1, 45.5
R2, 8.26 Y1
List $22.80

A

000014775

MN4032X004 QT 19.08 16.98
REGAL SELECT HB SFT-BASE 2
Color Number: 796
Color Name: Nova Scolia Plug

Formula: 1.5 51, 9 5 W1, 3 M1,
18.25 B1

List $23.99

MR

060061 4 '7/
06314 %004 19T - 24,00 24.849
AURA EXTERIOR SATIN-BASE 4
Color Number: 202230

ANN

2701 S. COLLEGE AVE. UNIT 160
FORT COLLINS, CO 80525
970-226-0262

STIC SCHOOL LARGE ICONS A

015586799064 %3, 49
REGULAR PRICE 4.99
STIC SCHOOL LARGE ICONS A e
015586799064 X349
REGULAR PRICE 4.99
STIC SCHOOL LARGE ICONS A &
015586799064 %349
REGULAR PRICE 4.99 -
SUBTOTAL 10.47
smmTM?sm% 0.30
COUNTY TAX 0,800 % 0.08
LOCAL TAX 3.850 % 0.40
TOTAL 11.25
CASH 11.25

How did we do?
Share vour feedback on our
strvev at www. joann.com/storesurvey

CusT

o

992228014348184563
TOTAL

TTEMS 3
07-13-20 04:16:22PM
002228 01 806801

s
£2

o Twosubject to a restocking fee.

L

il

2 Eift}szpdcéjk«Va %Kv

SN

~eturned sewing and Cricut maotnne:>




AURA EXTERIOR SATIN-BASE 4
Color Nurber: 2022.30
Color Name: Bright Yellow
Furmu}a: 25.5 \/\/l 85,5
LA »
0000014773
MN4033X004 QT 19.94 18,89
REGAL SELECT MR SFT-BASE 3
Color Nurnber; 8§57 :
Color Naire; Seq Of Grgen |
Forrnula; 0,75 §1, 35.6 W1, 3 Bi,
39.25 39
List $22 00

UM

000014777
2680126 7EA 0.48 3.43
3" JEN POLY BRUSH
List $0.69
250-100 BEA 0.28 232
o THJEN POLY BRUSH
List $0.30
002400001 1 GA 30.89 39.99
FEALL P ALK PRIMER-WHITE
List $51.0g
078-788 TEA 13.2a 13.24

4G THNR PNT PLETC CRS
List §13.09

SubTotal $183.97

Taxable Eco Fees $2.85
Sales Tax $12.80

Total $199. 62

MasterCar Terdered $109.87

Cdrd. 14»1:.1-*7:1;:*&’7084
Auth 047808
Trace: 7821
Referenca Mo: AAAAYLIW by
Entiy Legenq: Chip !
AlD Name: MASTERCARD
TVR: 0000008800
TSI EBoo
Change bue $0.00

Total Discount Savings $30.40
RECEIPT NEEDED FOR REFUND OR EXCHANGE
RESTOCKING CHARGES ON CUSTOM tDRDEffS

Monday to Friday 7.00-5:00
Sawrday 8:00 - 3:00

Yoo

Lol -,
e A
, e
A e N.‘&_“‘“w\
ot CIRROZG 12 2haa popn

NISV\/EI\JDER/JOY R
Buyer agraes io Pay total amuount alyove deeording Lo
cardholder'y agreerment with issyer,

LT

0001477

.75?51\43(,,A, %z10.57




Scott Bailey

Subject: FW: Little free library update

Two Story Shed Unfinished Kit
Mo Litlle Free Library
y T $26045

Begin forwarded message:

From: Little Free Library <customerservice@littlefreelibrary.org>
Subject: Order #48814 confirmed

Date: June 14, 2020 at 8:15:49 AM MDT

To: joeschroeder000@gmail.com

Thank you for placing an order with Little Free Library!
We have received and are processing your order. Your order details are below.

Please note that your items may ship separately, and some items may arrive sooner than others.
You will receive another email once we have finished processing your order.

Did you purchase a charter sign, and you'd like to know your charter number? You will need to
wait until your charter sign arrives to learn your charter number, which will be engraved on the
sign. Charter numbers cannot be provided in advance.

IMPORTANT: Please double-check your shipping address (listed below) to be sure it is correct.
That is the address where we will ship your items. If an item is returned because you entered the
wrong shipping address, you may be charged additional shipping costs to re-send your items.

If you have questions or concerns about your purchase, please contact us at ‘ . A
customerservice@littlefreelibrary.org \\J
\Y)

Date 06/14/2020

Shipping address /’E )
Joe Schroeder ) C(L
603 Goose Lake Ct : Py 7
Windsor, Colorado 80550 N /(l l

N
“)
United States é/

Billing address
Joe Schroeder
603 Goose Lake Ct



Windsor, Colorado 80550

United States

Ix Two Story Shed Unfinished Kit Little Free Library - Silver for $289.95 each

Subtotal : $289.95 USD
Shipping : $56.12 USD
Total :$346.07 USD

Payment has been received. No further payment is required.

Thank You!

Your Friends at Little Free Library
573 County Road A, Suite 106
Hudson, WI 54016



